
11/7/2018 CTemplar: Armored Email 

BE % 3 Nv Q 

We are in open beta. Please report all bugs to support@ctemplar.com 

Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 9% 

From: <notaryco@telus.net> Oct 30, 2018, 9:12:13 PM 

To: <mailinator@ctemplar.com> 

Kathleen: 

| am not set up for telephone card charges. A cheque is fine, | am not in a rush for it, so if it gets 

delayed by mail that's OK. 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R9 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

www.coquitlamnotarypublic.ca 

From: mailinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net" <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 4:10:47 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

Hello, Bart. 

Now, there's talk here of a postal disruption. 

Instead of throwing it in the mail and risk losing it, do notaries take Paypal? 

Or, can | give you my Master Card for the last $30.00 ? 

I'm going to presume you can take the card: 

Kathleen Moore Pageot 

5165 1100 1218 9947 

06/21 
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On Tue, October 23, 2018 at 5:51:46 PM <notaryco@telus.net> wrote: 

Hi 

| acknowledge receipt of the $200 already paid. You can simply send the balance at your 

earliest convenience. 

Thanks 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R9 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

www.coquitlamnotarypublic.ca 

From: mailinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net” <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2018 1:13:26 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

Hi, Bart. 

The way your account is written, it means | currently owe you $230.16 CASH. 

No mention is made that $200 CASH was paid, and only the balance of $30.16 is due. 

Sorry to put your secretary to extra work. 

Kind regards. 

==-—----- Original message ---------- 

From: <notaryco@telus.net> 

Date: Oct 23, 2018, 5:01:56 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

To: <mailinator@ctemplar.com> 
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To: <notaryco@telus.net> 

From: <mailinator@ctemplar.com> Nov 7,2018, 7:31:17 PM 

To: <notaryco@telus.net> 

Hello, Bart. 

Your last $30 is on the way as a Canada Post money order. 

My chip card has been malfunctioning, and it has poured with rain for days. 

The rain stopped today so | could make the long walk to get the cash to pay for the money order. 

It went in the mail at the Post Office itself (not a substation) just before 17:00 today. 

Kind regards. 

Kathleen Pageot 

Montreal 

On Wed, October 31,2018 at 9:57:13 PM <mailinator@ctemplar.com> wrote: 

Will do. Should go out tomorrow. 

Have a great day. 

On Tue, October 30,2018 at 9:12:13 PM <notaryco@telus.net> wrote: 

Kathleen: 

| am not set up for telephone card charges. A cheque is fine, | am notin a rush for it, so if it gets delayed 

by mail that's OK. 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R? 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

https://ctemplar.com/mail/sent/message/71625 37
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From: mallinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net" <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 4:10:47 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

Hello, Bart. 

Now, there's talk here of a postal disruption. 

Instead of throwing it in the mail and risk losing it, do notaries take Paypal? 

Or, can | give you my Master Card for the last $30.00? 

I'm going to presume you can take the card: 

Kathleen Moore Pageot 

5165 1100 1218 9947 

06/21 

196 

On Tue, October 23,2018 at 5:51:46 PM <notaryco@telus.net> wrote: 

Hi 

| acknowledge receipt of the $200 already paid. You can simply send the balance at your 

earliest convenience. 

Thanks 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R? 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

www.coquitlamnotarypublic.ca 

From: mailinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net" <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 23,2018 1:13:26 PM (9) 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 
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The way your account is written, it means | currently owe you $230.16 CASH. 

No mention is made that $200 CASH was paid, and only the balance of $30.16 is due. 

Sorry to put your secretary to extra work. 

Kind regards. 

—mmeee- Original message ---------- 

From: <notaryco@telus.net> 

Date: Oct 23,2018,5:01:56 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

To: <mailinator@ctemplar.com> 

On Tue, October 30,2018 at 9:12:13 PM <notaryco@telus.net> wrote: 

Kathleen: 

| am not set up for telephone card charges. A cheque is fine, | am not in a rush for it, so if it gets delayed 

by mail that's OK. 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R9 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

www.coquitlamnotarypublic.ca 

From: mailinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net" <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 30, 2018 4:10:47 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

Hello, Bart. (9) 

Now, there's talk here of a postal disruption. 
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I'm going to presume you can take the card: 

Kathleen Moore Pageot 

51651100 1218 9947 

06/21 

196 

On Tue, October 23,2018 at 5:51:46 PM <notaryco@telus.net> wrote: 

Hi 

| acknowledge receipt of the $200 already paid. You can simply send the balance at your 

earliest convenience. 

Thanks 

Bart 

PLEASE NOTE OUR NEW ADDRESS AS OF OCTOBER 1, 2017 

Bart Aldrich Notary Corporation 

#105 - 2655 Mary Hill Road 

Port Coquitlam, BC V3C 6R9 

Tel: 604-464-3136 

Fax: 604-464-4010 

notaryco@telus.net 

www.coquitlamnotarypublic.ca 

From: mailinator@ctemplar.com 

To: "notaryco@telus.net" <notaryco@telus.net> 

Sent: Tuesday, October 23,2018 1:13:26 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

Hi, Bart. 

The way your account is written, it means | currently owe you $230.16 CASH. 

No mention is made that $200 CASH was paid, and only the balance of $30.16 is due. 

Sorry to put your secretary to extra work. 

Kind regards. (9) 
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From: <notaryco@telus.net> 

Date: Oct 23,2018, 5:01:56 PM 

Subject: Re: BC Property Records for Marina Josephine Welham 

To: <mailinator@ctemplar.com> 

1-500f2346  €  ?> 
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